
Commodity: Manchester Biological Models
EKU 10-10 Opened: 10/20/09  

Vendor: Quantity
 Ward's         

Rochester  NY Model #

 Carolina 
Biological 

Supply 
Company   

Burlington NY Model #
SK Laboratories   
Tonawanda NY Model # Comments

1. Skeleton, articulated 1 1,175.00$                 82W3001 1,709.15$         246813  $              1,649.00 SP82-3001 only need one (1)

2. Skeleton, articulated 1 1,075.00$                 82W3600 1,709.15$         246814 1,569.00$               SP82-3600 only need one (1)
3. 3B Human Muscular Skeleton, 
disarticulated and entire with a 
carrying case 6 539.00$                    82W3021 721.10$            246782 599.00$                  SP32-3021

4. Adult Skull, Female 3 184.50$                    82W3613 170.15$            246955

5. Adult Skull, Male 3 206.10$                    82W3612 209.47$            246952  $                   37.00 SK46286-00 Adult skull, male from SK Labs is not medical grade - Wards is next cheapest - recommend purchase from Wards

6. Human Vertebrae Set 6 35.00$                      3BA75/1 53.25$              247536 30.45$                    SK47470-00 We also need higher quality on SK vertebrae - next lowest bid is Wards - recommend purchase from Wards

7. Human Pelvis, Female 2 49.00$                      82W1415 58.21$              247765 74.50$                    SP82-1415

8. Human Pelvis, Male 2 49.00$                      82W1414 58.21$             247755 $                   74.50 SP82-1414, $ $ $

9. 3B Lower limb (leg) musculature 6 569.00$                    81W1164 NO BID NO BID 554.22$                  SK46945-00
The SK quote on the lower limb and upper limb model is slightly different from the one photographed in the atlas. In order to 
avoid student confusion in referenced atlas, recommend we stay with the models referenced - next lowest bid would be Wards.

10. 3B Upper limb (arm) 
musculature model 6 413.00$                    81W1177 468.49$            566715 402.51$                  SK46976-00

11. 3B Muscular, Open-Back 
Torso Model 6 1,890.00$                 81W3096 NO BID NO BID 1,223.31$               SK46939-00

Torso model from SK is the cheapest bid, but it does not have full coverage of the organs in the front. This is preferable both for storage and educational purposes, 
this would be the only reference model for abdominal muscles. This is not covered in the original description mainly because I've never seen a torso model that doesn't 
have full coverage with the abdominal muscles. Recommend purchase of the only other bid, which is Wards.

12. 3B Circulatory System Model 6 232.00$                    81W1162 269.33$            566839  $                 258.00 SP81-1162

13. Altay Human Heart Model 12 34.80$                      81W3348 48.51$              566903A 47.95$                    SP81-3348

14. Somso Human Larynx, 
Trachea, & Bronchi Model 6 565.00$                    81W3140 597.22$            566914 669.00$                  SP81-3140

15. Somso Human Larynx Model 6 156.73$                    81W3120 324.85$            566912 179.00$                  SP81-3120

16. Human Lung Pathology Slide S 2 13.54$                      93W9078, 9076, 6920 15.26$              317010  NO BID NO BID

17. Teeth Activity Model 6 125.00$                    82W1284 NO BID NO BID 139.25$                  SP82-1284

18. Altay Stomach & Upper 
Digestive Organs Model 6 127.38$                    81W3350 NO BID NO BID 149.00$                  SP81-3350

19. Somso Human Brain 11 239.00$                    81W3916 243.67$            566791  $                 223.86 SK69066

20. Human Regional Brain Model 1 111.30$                    81W3351 128.21$            566790C 159.00$                  SP81-3351

21. Somso Human Spinal Cord 
Model, Cervical 3 290.00$                    81W4019 297.11$            566797 329.00$                  SP81-4019

22. Somso Human Spinal Cord 
Model, Thoracic 3 251.00$                    81W3021 263.77$            566798 279.00$                  SP81-3021

23. Skin Activity Model 6 125.00$                    82W1280 114.57$            567665  $                 139.25 SP82-1280

This is to certify that the attached is a true and exact copy of the tabulation of bids/proposals received for the above referenced project, that same was advertised and opened in the manner prescribed by the Commonwealth. signed_____________________ 



24. Altay Comprehensive Eye in 
Orbit 6 291.00$                    81W3311 278.59$            566953 271.38$                  SK1750-94

25. 3B Human Ear 6 133.00$                    81W3113 150.91$            566967 129.78$                  SK46941-00

26. Human Kidney, Nephron & 
Renal Corpuscle Model 6 199.00$                    81W3365 242.39$            566923A 177.69$                  SK1770-73

27. Human Female Half Pelvis Mod 6 141.00$                    81W3304 143.33$            566721A  $                 131.69 SK1770-75

28. Human Male Half Pelvis Model 6 130.00$                    81W3352 133.24$            566721 115.38$                  SK1770-76

29. Human Development Activity 
Model 2 110.00$                    81W3354 122.34$            563121 149.00$                  SP81-3354


